
   
  
 
  
 
Parker.com online transactions supplemental terms and conditions 
 
Some products offered through www.parker.com may be fulfilled by our distribution partners. Our 
distribution partners shipping and delivery terms and conditions may differ from those offered by Parker. 
When ordering a product sold by a distribution partner, you should check their terms and conditions for 
details on shipping and delivery. Parker is an agent of our distribution partner for the sole and express 
purpose of promoting the products and receiving funds as payment for their products sold through 
www.parker.com and transmitting those funds to the distribution partner. Parker calculates tax on the 
distributor's behalf in accordance to the states taxing regulation. Not all distributors participate in tax 
exemption. If you need a refund for tax charged on orders sold by Parker, please contact the fulfilling 
distribution partners customer service department. The contact information is provided on the Parker.com  
Manage Online Orders. Parker's receipt of funds on behalf of a distribution partner is equal to receipt of 
the funds directly by the distribution partner. When you make a payment to Parker for a distribution 
partner product, you have fulfilled your payment obligations and your debt due to the distribution partner 
extinguishes upon receipt by Parker. 
 
You should contact the distribution partner directly via the contact information provided for any inquiries or 
customer service issues related to their products, such as returns, and Parker regarding product warranty 
issues. As payment agent, Parker will refund any money to you for returns of the distributor partner's 
products via the payment method used to purchase the product, after we receive notice from the 
distributor partner that you have returned products to them in accordance with their return policy. 
Parker reserves the right to refuse or cancel any orders placed for products which the sale or use of such 
product in your state or jurisdiction is restricted or prohibited. 
 
Pricing errors may occur on www.parker.com from time to time, on items sold by Parker, or items sold by 
a distribution partner on www.parker.com. Parker attempts to correct all pricing errors as soon as they are 
discovered, or as soon as Parker receives notice of an error. Parker reserves the right to cancel any 
orders containing pricing errors, with no further obligations to you, even after your receipt of an order 
confirmation or shipping notice from Parker. Any payments you make to Parker for orders that are 
cancelled due to pricing errors will be refunded. 
 


